








 

Arrangements and measures implemented by the Hassan II Academy of Science and 
Technology to deal with the COVID-19 pandemic 

  

In accordance with the missions as defined by the law of its creation, in particular, the 
promotion of scientific research and the support of proposals intended to enlighten public 
authorities on decisions relating to scientific questions having an impact on the health, social 
and economic life of citizens, and within the framework of the national effort of solidarity, 
mutual help and mobilization of the Moroccan people, facing the coronavirus pandemic  
“COVID-19”; an effort to which called His Majesty the King, may God assist him. The Hassan 
II Academy of Science and Technology, in addition to its financial participation in the special 
COVID-19 fund, issued a press release (No. 1) on April 14, 2020, in which it particularly 
recommended, on a scientific level, a few actions allowing to better understand its nature, 
development and treatment. 

On Friday, May 1, the Work Committee of the Hassan II Academy of Science and Technology 
held a videoconference meeting to concretely implement these proposals as part of an action 
plan (press release N ° 3 of May 4th, 2020): 

 

Elements of the draft action plan adopted by the Work Committee 

Activity  Objectives  Date 

Organisation of a 

Webinar 

an online consultative meeting whose debates 

and discussions will help identify the issue and 

bring out relevant research axes on the COVID‐

19 pandemic and SARS‐COV‐2 virus. 

first week of May 

(Friday, May 15) 

‐Call for projects to be 

supported by the 

Academy  

‐ Define the terms of 

reference for the 

organisation of skill 

centers  

‐ Select a few relevant projects on 3 major 

themes   

‐ Medical 

‐ Technological 

‐ Modeling and artificial intelligence 

Preparation 

during May and 

launch of the 

procedures in 

early june  

Seminar   scientific research and innovation for post 

COVID‐19 resilience : what mobilization for 

global epidemiological research, diagnosis, 

screening and treatment? 

early july 



Constitution of a work 

group  

its  role  is  to make a  scientific evaluation and  

meta  analyses  on  each  of  the  retained 

research axes 

late may 

National seminar   retrospective study of the moroccan 

experience 

 

 

The Work Committee of the Hassan II Academy of Science and Technology adopted the 
following decisions: 

1 - Organize a webinar on May 15, bringing together Moroccan experts working in Morocco or 
abroad, to discuss all the actions taken or to be taken, in order to deal with the COVID-19 
pandemic. 

2 - Set aside a budget of 10 million DH and launch, from June 1, 2020, a call for research 
projects on the following three main themes: 

• Medical aspect in pandemics (notably COVID-19): genomics and genetic variability of 
SARS-COV-2, physiopathology, chemical and molecular epidemiology of the COVID-19 
pandemic (clinical axes, immunological and genetic axes). 

• Technology in the battle against coronavirus (manufacture and production of devices 
used in treatment such as artificial respirators, test kits…). 

• mathematical modeling and artificial intelligence for COVID-19 fight. 

This call for projects gives priority to multidisciplinary teams which may, in the medium term, 
constitute centers of expertise or centers of excellence in the field of epidemiology in general. 

3 - Constitute, by the end of May, a work group responsible for carrying out a scientific 
assessment of the COVID-19 pandemic. 

4 - Organize a seminar, in early July - if conditions allow -, on scientific research and innovation 
for post-COVID-19 resilience. 

5 - Organize, in late September - early October 2020 - and if conditions allow -, a national 
seminar on a retrospective study of the Moroccan experience in the pandemic fight. 

6 - Constitute, by the end of May, a work group carrying out a scientific assessment and meta-
analyzes on each of the selected research axes. 

7 - Organize - if conditions allow - in Rabat, on 23, 24 and 25 November 2020, the 3rd Congress 
of the African Council for Scientific Research and Innovation (ASRIC), of the African Union, 
under the selected theme "Epidemics and pandemics", as suggested by the Academy, with the 
participation of African Scientists and international experts. 

The Hassan II Academy of Science and Technology is committed to promoting biomedical 
research by encouraging the creation, through calls for projects, of skill centers that gather 
several multidisciplinary research units, notably in the fields of virology, bacteriology , 
immunology, serology, epidemiology as well as in modeling and technology. The Academy 
intends to give a financial support to these structures. The Hassan II Academy of Science and 
Technology renews its proposal for the creation of a national structure bringing together 
researchers and units in biomedicine, by orienting their national priority actions, and by 
financially encouraging their research projects. 



In its declaration of May 4, 2020, the Hassan II Academy of Science and Technology gives the 
conditions for the end of the lockdown and in particular, the need for an approach protecting 
the country from any rebound effect, thanks to a global, coherent and gradual strategy which 
integrates the use of technical means based on digital science and artificial intelligence. 

The Hassan II Academy of Science and Technology recalls its full support to all the scientific, 
technological, medical, health, social and economic measures implemented to deal with the 
COVID-19 pandemic. 


